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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449

TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for HP Printer Ink, Toner & Printer Supplies
FOR: Original (OEM)
TIME & (October 1, 2012 through September 30, 2013)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 27, 2012
  
ITEM NO.

LAWSON 

NO.
Description 1 Description 2

MFG No./

PART No.
UOM MFG CODE Qty  PRICE 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE 
 PRICE 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE 
 PRICE 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE 
 PRICE 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE 
 PRICE 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE 
 PRICE 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE 
1326 HP 51645A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK 51645A 51645A EA  HP 20 27.50$        550.00$              24.00$     480.00$          29.34$               586.80$           35.00$         700.00$             35.99$         719.80$            45.00$        900.00$              
1959 CANON BCI-6Y 4708A003 OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW 4708A003 4708A003 EA  CANON 3 10.24$        30.72$                11.00$     33.00$             9.11$                 27.33$              12.50$         37.50$               16.99$         50.97$               16.00$        48.00$                
2039 HP C4821A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4821A C4821A EA  HP 3 100.00$      300.00$              124.00$   372.00$          125.56$            376.68$           149.00$       447.00$             163.99$      491.97$            199.00$      597.00$              
2040 HP 4127X OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4127X C4127X EA  HP 20 95.00$        1,900.00$          104.00$   2,080.00$       127.09$            2,541.80$        148.00$       2,960.00$         169.99$      3,399.80$         199.00$      3,980.00$           
2438 CANON BCI-21E 0955A003  OEM COLOR INK TANK OEM COLOR INK TANK 0895A003 0895A003 EA  CANON 3 17.92$        53.76$                25.00$     75.00$             17.22$               51.66$              25.00$         75.00$               No Bid No Bid 32.00$        96.00$                
2439 CANON BCI-6M 4707A003 OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA 4707A003 4707A003 EA  CANON 3 10.21$        30.63$                9.00$        27.00$             9.11$                 27.33$              12.50$         37.50$               13.99$         41.97$               16.00$        48.00$                
2542 HP 51626A OEM BLACK    OEM BLACK     51626A 51626A EA  HP 3 2.00$          6.00$                   26.00$     78.00$             29.57$               88.71$              36.00$         108.00$             38.99$         116.97$            45.00$        135.00$              
2543 HP C3903A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C3903A C3903A EA  HP 10 60.00$        600.00$              90.00$     900.00$          93.80$               938.00$           108.00$       1,080.00$         123.99$      1,239.90$         142.00$      1,420.00$           
2546 HP 92298A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK 92298A 92298A EA  HP 6 60.00$        360.00$              108.00$   648.00$          111.29$            667.74$           127.00$       762.00$             132.99$      797.94$            174.00$      1,044.00$           
2547 HP C9703A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9703A C9703A EA  HP 6 10.00$        60.00$                86.00$     516.00$          87.94$               527.64$           100.00$       600.00$             103.99$      623.94$            139.00$      834.00$              
2548 HP 51644C  OEM CYAN OEM CYAN 51644C 51644C EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                33.00$     99.00$             33.77$               101.31$           41.00$         123.00$             43.99$         131.97$            55.00$        165.00$              
2549 HP C9720A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C9720A C9720A EA  HP 9 150.00$      1,350.00$          155.00$   1,395.00$       157.27$            1,415.43$        179.50$       1,615.50$         199.99$      1,799.91$         236.00$      2,124.00$           
2552 HP C4813A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4813A C4813A EA  HP 3 29.00$        87.00$                32.00$     96.00$             32.33$               96.99$              38.50$         115.50$             41.99$         125.97$            55.00$        165.00$              
2554 HP Q3963A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA Q3963A Q3963A EA  HP 3 70.00$        210.00$              88.00$     264.00$          87.94$               263.82$           100.00$       300.00$             114.99$      344.97$            139.00$      417.00$              
2559 HP C1823D OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR C1823D C1823D EA  HP 3 15.00$        45.00$                34.00$     102.00$          36.80$               110.40$           44.00$         132.00$             47.99$         143.97$            61.00$        183.00$              
2560 HP C8061X  OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C8061X C8061X EA  HP 30 95.00$        2,850.00$          99.00$     2,970.00$       127.09$            3,812.70$        148.00$       4,440.00$         167.99$      5,039.70$         203.00$      6,090.00$           
2562 HP C9704A OEM IMAGING DRUM OEM IMAGING DRUM C9704A C9704A EA  HP 3 50.00$        150.00$              186.00$   558.00$          151.73$            455.19$           214.50$       643.50$             197.99$      593.97$            240.00$      720.00$              
2564 HP C4837A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4837A C4837A EA  HP 6 65.00$        390.00$              30.00$     180.00$          31.52$               189.12$           37.50$         225.00$             40.99$         245.94$            52.00$        312.00$              
2566 HP C9723A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9723A C9723A EA  HP 3 163.00$      489.00$              211.00$   633.00$          211.02$            633.06$           243.00$       729.00$             272.99$      818.97$            333.00$      999.00$              
2567 HP C9722A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9722A C9722A EA  HP 3 163.00$      489.00$              211.00$   633.00$          211.02$            633.06$           243.00$       729.00$             272.99$      818.97$            333.00$      999.00$              
2568 HP C9721A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9721A C9721A EA  HP 3 163.00$      489.00$              165.00$   495.00$          211.02$            633.06$           243.00$       729.00$             272.99$      818.97$            333.00$      999.00$              
2569 HP C4182X  OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4182X C4182X EA  HP 30 165.00$      4,950.00$          88.00$     2,640.00$       189.77$            5,693.10$        218.50$       6,555.00$         244.99$      7,349.70$         299.00$      8,970.00$           
2571 HP C9702A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9702A C9702A EA  HP 3 10.00$        30.00$                212.00$   636.00$          87.94$               263.82$           100.00$       300.00$             114.99$      344.97$            139.00$      417.00$              
2574 HP C9730A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C9730A C9730A EA  HP 30 190.00$      5,700.00$          212.00$   6,360.00$       213.82$            6,414.60$        248.50$       7,455.00$         277.99$      8,339.70$         343.00$      10,290.00$        
2576 HP C9732A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9732A C9732A EA  HP 30 272.00$      8,160.00$          212.00$   6,360.00$       299.85$            8,995.50$        348.50$       10,455.00$       389.99$      11,699.70$       481.00$      14,430.00$        
2577 HP Q3960A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q3960A Q3960A EA  HP 6 55.00$        330.00$              69.00$     414.00$          72.90$               437.40$           83.00$         498.00$             94.99$         569.94$            116.00$      696.00$              
2578 HP Q3961A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN Q3961A Q3961A EA  HP 3 65.00$        195.00$              80.00$     240.00$          87.94$               263.82$           100.00$       300.00$             114.99$      344.97$            139.00$      417.00$              
2580 HP Q3964A OEM DRUMKIT OEM DRUMKIT Q3964A Q3964A EA  HP 3 125.00$      375.00$              134.00$   402.00$          151.73$            455.19$           214.50$       643.50$             195.99$      587.97$            240.00$      720.00$              
2581 HP Q1338A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q1338A Q1338A EA  HP 30 119.00$      3,570.00$          113.00$   3,390.00$       133.13$            3,993.90$        155.00$       4,650.00$         172.99$      5,189.70$         210.00$      6,300.00$           
2584 HP C4842A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4842A C4842A EA  HP 6 29.00$        174.00$              31.00$     186.00$          29.60$               177.60$           34.50$         207.00$             39.99$         239.94$            49.00$        294.00$              
2794 HP C4820A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4820A C4820A EA  HP 3 100.00$      300.00$              122.00$   366.00$          125.56$            376.68$           149.00$       447.00$             163.99$      491.97$            199.00$      597.00$              
2795 HP C4812A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4812A C4812A EA  HP 3 20.00$        60.00$                30.00$     90.00$             32.33$               96.99$              38.50$         115.50$             41.99$         125.97$            52.00$        156.00$              
2845 HP C4844A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4844A C4844A EA  HP 35 30.00$        1,050.00$          24.00$     840.00$          30.91$               1,081.85$        37.00$         1,295.00$         39.99$         1,399.65$         51.00$        1,785.00$           
2846 HP C4810A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4810A C4810A EA  HP 3 20.00$        60.00$                32.00$     96.00$             32.33$               96.99$              38.50$         115.50$             41.99$         125.97$            52.00$        156.00$              
2854 HP C9700A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C9700A C9700A EA  HP 6 5.00$          30.00$                69.00$     414.00$          72.90$               437.40$           83.00$         498.00$             94.99$         569.94$            116.00$      696.00$              
2922 HP C9701A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9701A C9701A EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                84.00$     252.00$          87.94$               263.82$           100.00$       300.00$             114.99$      344.97$            139.00$      417.00$              
3157 HP C4822A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4822A C4822A EA  HP 3 90.00$        270.00$              123.00$   369.00$          125.56$            376.68$           149.00$       447.00$             163.99$      491.97$            199.00$      597.00$              
3158 HP C4129X  OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4129X C4129X EA  HP 12 130.00$      1,560.00$          155.00$   1,860.00$       164.57$            1,974.84$        189.50$       2,274.00$         218.99$      2,627.88$         256.00$      3,072.00$           
3159 HP C6578AN OEM TRICOLOR HIGH YIELD OEM TRICOLOR HIGH YIELD C6578AN C6578AN EA  HP 3 52.00$        156.00$              53.00$     159.00$          54.90$               164.70$           64.00$         192.00$             69.99$         209.97$            87.00$        261.00$              
3160 HP C4841A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4841A C4841A EA  HP 3 28.00$        84.00$                28.00$     84.00$             29.60$               88.80$              36.00$         108.00$             39.99$         119.97$            48.00$        144.00$              
3161 HP C4836A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4836A C4836A EA  HP 9 28.00$        252.00$              28.00$     252.00$          31.52$               283.68$           37.50$         337.50$             40.99$         368.91$            51.00$        459.00$              
3669 CANON BCI-11 0958A003 OEM COLOR INK TANK OEM COLOR INK TANK 0958A003 0958A003 EA  CANON 3 17.48$        52.44$                20.00$     60.00$             No Bid No Bid 25.00$         75.00$               No Bid No Bid 24.00$        72.00$                
4025 HP C4823A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4823A C4823A EA  HP 3 100.00$      300.00$              123.00$   369.00$          125.56$            376.68$           149.00$       447.00$             163.99$      491.97$            149.28$      447.84$              
4026 HP C4811A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4811A C4811A EA  HP 3 27.00$        81.00$                32.00$     96.00$             32.33$               96.99$              38.50$         115.50$             41.99$         125.97$            52.00$        156.00$              
6099 HP 51629A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK 51629A 51629A EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                28.00$     84.00$             29.12$               87.36$              35.00$         105.00$             37.99$         113.97$            46.00$        138.00$              
6100 HP 51640A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK 51640A 51640A EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                26.00$     78.00$             27.61$               82.83$              33.50$         100.50$             35.99$         107.97$            44.00$        132.00$              
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27772 HP C4096A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4096A C4096A EA  HP 3 70.00$        210.00$              99.00$     297.00$          101.91$            305.73$           116.00$       348.00$             131.99$      395.97$            161.00$      483.00$              
27776 HP C3906A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C3906A C3906A EA  HP 6 5.00$          30.00$                72.00$     432.00$          72.34$               434.04$           82.50$         495.00$             93.99$         563.94$            114.00$      684.00$              
27778 HP C3909A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C3909A C3909A EA  HP 6 125.00$      750.00$              200.00$   1,200.00$       204.10$            1,224.60$        232.50$       1,395.00$         266.99$      1,601.94$         312.00$      1,872.00$           
27780 HP C4092A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4092A C4092A EA  HP 6 40.00$        240.00$              59.00$     354.00$          62.81$               376.86$           71.50$         429.00$             81.99$         491.94$            99.00$        594.00$              
27782 HP Q2613X  OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q2613X Q2613X EA  HP 3 72.00$        216.00$              90.00$     270.00$          90.02$               270.06$           83.00$         249.00$             116.99$      350.97$            137.00$      411.00$              
27788 HP C7115A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C7115A C7115A EA  HP 3 42.00$        126.00$              48.00$     144.00$          61.99$               185.97$           70.50$         211.50$             79.99$         239.97$            98.00$        294.00$              
27813 HP 51649A OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR 51649A 51649A EA  HP 3 15.00$        45.00$                28.00$     84.00$             30.52$               91.56$              37.00$         111.00$             39.99$         119.97$            48.00$        144.00$              
27815 HP C6615DN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C6615DN C6615DN EA  HP 3 27.87$        83.61$                26.00$     78.00$             28.27$               84.81$              33.00$         99.00$               35.99$         107.97$            43.00$        129.00$              
27817 HP 51641A OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR 51641A 51641A EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                30.00$     90.00$             30.77$               92.31$              37.00$         111.00$             41.99$         125.97$            47.00$        141.00$              
27819 HP C6578DN OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR C6578DN C6578DN EA  HP 3 32.00$        96.00$                28.00$     84.00$             31.40$               94.20$              36.50$         109.50$             39.99$         119.97$            49.00$        147.00$              
27822 HP 51644M  OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA 51644M 51644M EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                33.00$     99.00$             33.77$               101.31$           41.00$         123.00$             43.99$         131.97$            54.00$        162.00$              
27824 HP 51644Y  OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW 51644Y 51644Y EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                33.00$     99.00$             33.77$               101.31$           41.00$         123.00$             43.99$         131.97$            54.00$        162.00$              
27831 HP C4911A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4911A C4911A EA  HP 30 31.36$        940.80$              24.00$     720.00$          31.34$               940.20$           37.50$         1,125.00$         40.99$         1,229.70$         49.00$        1,470.00$           
27833 HP C4912A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4912A C4912A EA  HP 30 31.36$        940.80$              24.00$     720.00$          31.34$               940.20$           37.50$         1,125.00$         40.99$         1,229.70$         49.00$        1,470.00$           
27835 HP C4913A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4913A C4913A EA  HP 30 31.36$        940.80$              24.00$     720.00$          31.34$               940.20$           37.50$         1,125.00$         40.99$         1,229.70$         49.00$        1,470.00$           
27837 HP C4871A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4871A C4871A EA  HP 30 128.66$      3,859.80$          119.00$   3,570.00$       121.44$            3,643.20$        147.00$       4,410.00$         161.99$      4,859.70$         196.00$      5,880.00$           
27839 HP C4874A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4874A C4874A EA  HP 6 79.08$        474.48$              74.00$     444.00$          75.92$               455.52$           91.50$         549.00$             99.99$         599.94$            120.00$      720.00$              
27841 HP C4873A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4873A C4873A EA  HP 6 79.08$        474.48$              74.00$     444.00$          75.92$               455.52$           91.50$         549.00$             99.99$         599.94$            120.00$      720.00$              
27843 HP C4872A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4872A C4872A EA  HP 3 79.08$        237.24$              76.00$     228.00$          75.92$               227.76$           91.50$         274.50$             99.99$         299.97$            120.00$      360.00$              
27845 HP C4930A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4930A C4930A EA  HP 3 200.27$      600.81$              189.00$   567.00$          189.91$            569.73$           231.50$       694.50$             253.99$      761.97$            298.00$      894.00$              
27847 HP C4931A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4931A C4931A EA  HP 3 200.27$      600.81$              189.00$   567.00$          189.91$            569.73$           231.50$       694.50$             253.99$      761.97$            298.00$      894.00$              
27849 HP C4932A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4932A C4932A EA  HP 3 200.27$      600.81$              189.00$   567.00$          189.91$            569.73$           231.50$       694.50$             253.99$      761.97$            298.00$      894.00$              
27851 HP C4933A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4933A C4933A EA  HP 3 200.27$      600.81$              189.00$   567.00$          189.91$            569.73$           231.50$       694.50$             253.99$      761.97$            298.00$      894.00$              
27871 CANON BCI-3E 4479A271  OEM BLACK OEM BLACK 4479A271 4479A271 EA  CANON 3 13.15$        39.45$                25.00$     75.00$             22.46$               67.38$              26.00$         78.00$               15.99$         47.97$               32.00$        96.00$                
27873 CANON BCI-3C 4480A003  OEM CYAN OEM CYAN 4480A003 4480A003 EA  CANON 3 10.19$        30.57$                12.00$     36.00$             8.85$                 26.55$              11.50$         34.50$               11.99$         35.97$               16.00$        48.00$                
27875 CANON BCI-3M 4481A003 OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA 4481A003 4481A003 EA  CANON 3 9.61$          28.83$                12.00$     36.00$             8.85$                 26.55$              11.50$         34.50$               11.99$         35.97$               16.00$        48.00$                
27877 CANON BCI-3Y 4482A003 OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW 4482A003 4482A003 EA  CANON 3 9.61$          28.83$                12.00$     36.00$             8.85$                 26.55$              11.50$         34.50$               11.99$         35.97$               16.00$        48.00$                
27879 CANON BCI-6 4715A003  OEM BLACK OEM BLACK 4715A003 4715A003 EA  CANON 3 11.31$        33.93$                15.00$     45.00$             9.11$                 27.33$              25.00$         75.00$               71.99$         215.97$            19.00$        57.00$                
27881 CANON BCI-6C 4706A003 OEM CYAN OEM CYAN 4706A003 4706A003 EA  CANON 3 11.31$        33.93$                15.00$     45.00$             9.11$                 27.33$              12.50$         37.50$               13.99$         41.97$               16.00$        48.00$                
30792 HP C9731A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9731A C9731A EA  HP 30 272.00$      8,160.00$          299.00$   8,970.00$       298.37$            8,951.10$        349.00$       10,470.00$       389.99$      11,699.70$       469.00$      14,070.00$        
30795 HP C9733A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9733A C9733A EA  HP 15 272.00$      4,080.00$          299.00$   4,485.00$       298.37$            4,475.55$        349.00$       5,235.00$         389.99$      5,849.85$         469.00$      7,035.00$           
30806 HP Q3962A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW Q3962A Q3962A EA  HP 3 60.00$        180.00$              88.00$     264.00$          87.94$               263.82$           100.00$       300.00$             114.99$      344.97$            134.00$      402.00$              
32359 HP C9386AN OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9386AN C9386AN EA  HP 3 11.75$        35.25$                12.00$     36.00$             12.72$               38.16$              15.50$         46.50$               16.99$         50.97$               21.00$        63.00$                
32361 HP C9387AN OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9387AN C9387AN EA  HP 3 11.75$        35.25$                12.00$     36.00$             12.72$               38.16$              15.50$         46.50$               15.99$         47.97$               21.00$        63.00$                
32363 HP C9388AN OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9388AN C9388AN EA  HP 3 11.75$        35.25$                12.00$     36.00$             12.72$               38.16$              15.50$         46.50$               15.99$         47.97$               21.00$        63.00$                
33144 HP C9385AN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C9385AN C9385AN EA  HP 3 17.62$        52.86$                18.00$     54.00$             18.71$               56.13$              22.00$         66.00$               23.99$         71.97$               29.00$        87.00$                
33226 HP Q7551A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q7551A Q7551A EA  HP 3 110.00$      330.00$              98.00$     294.00$          114.51$            343.53$           130.50$       391.50$             144.99$      434.97$            176.00$      528.00$              
33227 HP Q6470A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q6470A Q6470A EA  HP 3 109.00$      327.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.84$            350.52$           133.50$       400.50$             147.99$      443.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
33229 HP Q6471A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN Q6471A Q6471A EA  HP 3 109.00$      327.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.45$            349.35$           133.00$       399.00$             150.99$      452.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
33231 HP Q6472A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW Q6472A Q6472A EA  HP 3 109.00$      327.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.45$            349.35$           133.00$       399.00$             150.99$      452.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
33233 HP Q6473A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA Q6473A Q6473A EA  HP 3 109.00$      327.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.45$            349.35$           133.00$       399.00$             150.99$      452.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
33236 HP CB335WN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK CB335WN CB335WN EA  HP 3 11.88$        35.64$                15.00$     45.00$             12.79$               38.37$              15.50$         46.50$               15.99$         47.97$               21.00$        63.00$                
33238 HP CB336WN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK CB336WN CB336WN EA  HP 3 28.37$        85.11$                32.00$     96.00$             31.09$               93.27$              37.00$         111.00$             39.99$         119.97$            48.00$        144.00$              
33240 HP CB337WN OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR CB337WN CB337WN EA  HP 3 15.09$        45.27$                17.00$     51.00$             16.15$               48.45$              19.50$         58.50$               20.99$         62.97$               29.00$        87.00$                
33260 HP CC530A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK CC530A CC530A EA  HP 3 88.00$        264.00$              73.00$     219.00$          97.86$               293.58$           111.50$       334.50$             125.99$      377.97$            155.00$      465.00$              
33261 HP CC531A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN CC531A CC531A EA  HP 3 95.00$        285.00$              84.00$     252.00$          96.46$               289.38$           110.00$       330.00$             123.99$      371.97$            154.00$      462.00$              
33262 HP CC532A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW CC532A CC532A EA  HP 3 95.00$        285.00$              84.00$     252.00$          96.46$               289.38$           110.00$       330.00$             123.99$      371.97$            154.00$      462.00$              
33263 HP CC532A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA CC533A CC533A EA  HP 3 95.00$        285.00$              84.00$     252.00$          96.46$               289.38$           110.00$       330.00$             123.99$      371.97$            154.00$      462.00$              
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33295 HP C6656AN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C6656AN C6656AN EA  HP 3 20.17$        60.51$                20.00$     60.00$             20.26$               60.78$              24.00$         72.00$               25.99$         77.97$               35.00$        105.00$              
33296 HP C6657AN OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR C6657AN C6657AN EA  HP 3 32.00$        96.00$                25.00$     75.00$             32.90$               98.70$              38.50$         115.50$             41.99$         125.97$            51.00$        153.00$              
33414 HP C4838A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4838 C4838 EA  HP 3 28.72$        86.16$                32.00$     96.00$             31.52$               94.56$              37.50$         112.50$             40.99$         122.97$            49.00$        147.00$              
33415 HP Q6000A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q6000A Q6000A EA  HP 3 62.00$        186.00$              59.00$     177.00$          66.78$               200.34$           76.50$         229.50$             85.99$         257.97$            104.00$      312.00$              
33416 HP Q6001A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN Q6001A Q6001A EA  HP 3 68.00$        204.00$              62.00$     186.00$          72.90$               218.70$           83.00$         249.00$             94.99$         284.97$            116.00$      348.00$              
33417 HP Q6002A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA Q6002A Q6002A EA  HP 3 68.00$        204.00$              62.00$     186.00$          72.90$               218.70$           83.00$         249.00$             94.99$         284.97$            116.00$      348.00$              
33418 HP Q6003A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW Q6003A Q6003A EA  HP 3 68.00$        204.00$              62.00$     186.00$          72.90$               218.70$           83.00$         249.00$             94.99$         284.97$            116.00$      348.00$              
33747 HP C9724A OEM IMAGE TRANSFER KIT OEM IMAGE TRANSFER KIT C9724A C9724A EA  HP 3 180.00$      540.00$              205.00$   615.00$          220.32$            660.96$           275.00$       825.00$             277.99$      833.97$            385.00$      1,155.00$           
33756 HP Q5942A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q5942A Q5942A EA  HP 3 145.00$      435.00$              113.00$   339.00$          131.66$            394.98$           150.00$       450.00$             173.99$      521.97$            209.00$      627.00$              
33777 HP CE250A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK CE250A CE250A EA  HP 3 105.16$      315.48$              106.00$   318.00$          107.18$            321.54$           122.50$       367.50$             136.99$      410.97$            171.00$      513.00$              
33842 HP Q2612A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q2612A Q2612A EA  HP 3 59.70$        179.10$              52.00$     156.00$          61.86$               185.58$           70.50$         211.50$             77.99$         233.97$            171.00$      513.00$              
33897 HP CE251A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN CE251A CE251A EA  HP 3 200.00$      600.00$              108.00$   324.00$          210.44$            631.32$           240.00$       720.00$             266.99$      800.97$            330.00$      990.00$              
33898 HP CE252A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW CE252A CE252A EA  HP 3 200.00$      600.00$              108.00$   324.00$          210.44$            631.32$           240.00$       720.00$             266.99$      800.97$            330.00$      990.00$              
33899 HP CE253A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA CE253A CE253A EA  HP 3 200.00$      600.00$              108.00$   324.00$          210.44$            631.32$           240.00$       720.00$             266.99$      800.97$            330.00$      990.00$              
34104 HP Q2671A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN Q2671A Q2671A EA  HP 3 108.00$      324.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.45$            349.35$           133.00$       399.00$             151.99$      455.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
34105 HP Q2672A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW Q2671A Q2671A EA  HP 3 108.00$      324.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.45$            349.35$           133.00$       399.00$             151.99$      455.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
34106 HP Q2673A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA Q2673A Q2673A EA  HP 3 108.00$      324.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.45$            349.35$           133.00$       399.00$             151.99$      455.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
34107 HP Q2670A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK Q2670A Q2670A EA  HP 3 108.00$      324.00$              99.00$     297.00$          116.84$            350.52$           133.50$       400.50$             150.99$      452.97$            178.00$      534.00$              
34686 BROTHER TN3330 OEM BLACK OEM BLACK TN330 TN330 EA  BRO 6 30.49$        182.94$              37.00$     222.00$          30.97$               185.82$           37.00$         222.00$             39.99$         239.94$            53.00$        318.00$              
36188 HP C9371A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9371A C9371A EA  HP 3 48.00$        144.00$              52.00$     156.00$          50.51$               151.53$           59.00$         177.00$             64.99$         194.97$            80.00$        240.00$              
36189 HP C9373A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9373A C9373A EA  HP 3 48.00$        144.00$              52.00$     156.00$          50.51$               151.53$           59.00$         177.00$             64.99$         194.97$            80.00$        240.00$              
36190 HP C9372A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9372A C9372A EA  HP 3 48.00$        144.00$              52.00$     156.00$          50.51$               151.53$           59.00$         177.00$             64.99$         194.97$            80.00$        240.00$              
36191 HP C9370A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C9370A C9370A EA  HP 3 48.00$        144.00$              52.00$     156.00$          50.51$               151.53$           59.00$         177.00$             64.99$         194.97$            80.00$        240.00$              
36192 HP C9374A OEM GREY OEM GREY C9374A C9374A EA  HP 3 48.00$        144.00$              52.00$     156.00$          50.51$               151.53$           59.00$         177.00$             64.99$         194.97$            80.00$        240.00$              

HP C4902AN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4902AN C4902AN EA  HP 3 20.14$        60.42$                22.00$     66.00$             21.31$               63.93$              25.00$         75.00$               27.99$         83.97$               33.00$        99.00$                
HP C4906AN XL OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C4906AN C4906AN EA  HP 3 29.38$        88.14$                33.00$     99.00$             32.44$               97.32$              38.00$         114.00$             41.99$         125.97$            51.00$        153.00$              
HP C8767WN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C8767WN C8767WN EA  HP 3 28.67$        86.01$                32.00$     96.00$             28.81$               86.43$              34.00$         102.00$             36.99$         110.97$            45.00$        135.00$              
HP C9396AN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK C9396AN C9396AN EA  HP 3 30.07$        90.21$                35.00$     105.00$          33.63$               100.89$           39.00$         117.00$             42.99$         128.97$            53.00$        159.00$              
HP CC640WN OEM BLACK OEM BLACK CC640WN CC640WN EA  HP 3 11.88$        35.64$                14.00$     42.00$             12.11$               36.33$              14.50$         43.50$               17.99$         53.97$               20.00$        60.00$                
HP CE740A OEM BLACK OEM BLACK CE740A CE740A EA  HP 3 155.00$      465.00$              122.00$   366.00$          118.50$            355.50$           136.50$       409.50$             155.99$      467.97$            182.00$      546.00$              
HP C9403A OEM BLACK HIGH YIELD OEM BLACK HIGH YIELD C9403A C9403A EA  HP 3 52.47$        157.41$              53.00$     159.00$          50.51$               151.53$           59.00$         177.00$             66.99$         200.97$            80.00$        240.00$              
HP C9409A OEM BLACK RED PRINTHEAD OEM BLACK RED PRINTHEAD C9409A C9409A EA  HP 3 46.09$        138.27$              52.00$     156.00$          48.65$               145.95$           59.00$         177.00$             63.99$         191.97$            72.00$        216.00$              
HP C4900A OEM BLACK YELLOW PRINTHEAD OEM BLACK YELLOW PRINTHEAD C4900A C4900A EA  HP 3 31.53$        94.59$                48.31$     144.93$          49.24$               147.72$           58.50$         175.50$             63.99$         191.97$            74.00$        222.00$              
HP C9408A OEM BLUEGREEN PRINTHEAD OEM BLUEGREEN PRINTHEAD C9408A C9408A EA  HP 3 46.09$        138.27$              49.73$     149.19$          48.65$               145.95$           59.00$         177.00$             63.99$         191.97$            74.00$        222.00$              
HP C4903AN OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4903AN C4903AN EA  HP 3 52.47$        157.41$              17.00$     51.00$             15.77$               47.31$              18.50$         55.50$               20.99$         62.97$               29.00$        87.00$                
HP C4903AN OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4903AN C4903AN EA  HP 3 52.47$        157.41$              17.00$     51.00$             15.77$               47.31$              18.50$         55.50$               20.99$         62.97$               29.00$        87.00$                
HP C4907AN XL OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C4907AN C4907AN EA  HP 3 52.47$        157.41$              22.65$     67.95$             21.62$               64.86$              25.50$         76.50$               27.99$         83.97$               34.00$        102.00$              
HP C9391AN OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9391AN C9391AN EA  HP 3 18.94$        56.82$                22.11$     66.33$             21.07$               63.21$              25.00$         75.00$               26.99$         80.97$               34.00$        102.00$              
HP C9398A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN C9398A C9398A EA  HP 3 35.83$        107.49$              35.64$     106.92$          34.59$               103.77$           42.00$         126.00$             44.99$         134.97$            55.00$        165.00$              
HP CE741A OEM CYAN OEM CYAN CE741A CE741A EA  HP 3 239.00$      717.00$              215.00$   645.00$          207.70$            623.10$           240.50$       721.50$             274.99$      824.97$            330.00$      990.00$              
HP C4901A OEM CYAN MAGENTA PRINTHEAD OEM CYAN MAGENTA PRINTHEAD C4901A C4901A EA  HP 3 39.60$        118.80$              51.00$     153.00$          49.24$               147.72$           58.50$         175.50$             63.99$         191.97$            78.00$        234.00$              
HP C9404A OEM CYANBLACK PRINTHEAD OEM CYANBLACK PRINTHEAD C9404A C9404A EA  HP 3 46.09$        138.27$              36.00$     108.00$          48.65$               145.95$           59.00$         177.00$             63.99$         191.97$            77.00$        231.00$              
HP C9401A OEM GRAY OEM GRAY C9401A C9401A EA  HP 3 34.53$        103.59$              35.64$     106.92$          34.59$               103.77$           42.00$         126.00$             46.99$         140.97$            55.00$        165.00$              
HP C9405A OEM LCYAN LMAGENTA PRINTHEAD OEM LCYAN LMAGENTA PRINTHEAD C9405A C9405A EA  HP 3 43.09$        129.27$              49.73$     149.19$          48.65$               145.95$           59.00$         177.00$             63.99$         191.97$            76.00$        228.00$              
HP C9390A OEM LIGHT CYAN OEM LIGHT CYAN C9390A C9390A EA  HP 3 57.15$        171.45$              58.51$     175.53$          57.43$               172.29$           69.50$         208.50$             74.99$         224.97$            89.00$        267.00$              
HP C4904AN OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4904AN C4904AN EA  HP 3 12.74$        38.22$                16.80$     50.40$             15.77$               47.31$              18.50$         55.50$               20.99$         62.97$               29.00$        87.00$                
HP C4908AN XL OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C4908AN C4908AN EA  HP 3 17.74$        53.22$                23.65$     70.95$             21.62$               64.86$              25.00$         75.00$               27.99$         83.97$               34.00$        102.00$              
HP C9392AN OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9392AN C9392AN EA  HP 3 17.74$        53.22$                23.00$     69.00$             21.07$               63.21$              25.00$         75.00$               36.99$         110.97$            34.00$        102.00$              
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HP C9399A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA C9399A C9399A EA  HP 3 34.53$        103.59$              36.00$     108.00$          34.59$               103.77$           42.00$         126.00$             44.99$         134.97$            55.00$        165.00$              
HP CE743A OEM MAGENTA OEM MAGENTA CE743A CE743A EA  HP 3 239.00$      717.00$              214.00$   642.00$          207.70$            623.10$           240.50$       721.50$             274.99$      824.97$            330.00$      990.00$              
HP C9397A OEM PHOTO BLACK OEM PHOTO BLACK C9397A C9397A EA  HP 3 5.00$          15.00$                37.00$     111.00$          34.59$               103.77$           42.00$         126.00$             44.99$         134.97$            55.00$        165.00$              
HP C9369WN OEM PHOTO INK OEM PHOTO INK C9369WN C9369WN EA  HP 3 22.31$        66.93$                26.00$     78.00$             24.58$               73.74$              30.00$         90.00$               31.99$         95.97$               39.00$        117.00$              
HP C9349FN OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR C9349FN C9349FN EA  HP 3 62.00$        186.00$              66.00$     198.00$          64.65$               193.95$           75.50$         226.50$             82.99$         248.97$            98.00$        294.00$              
HP CC644WN OEM TRICOLOR OEM TRICOLOR CC644WN CC644WN EA  HP 3 33.00$        99.00$                35.00$     105.00$          33.55$               100.65$           39.50$         118.50$             42.99$         128.97$            51.00$        153.00$              
HP C4905AN OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4905AN C4905AN EA  HP 3 10.00$        30.00$                17.00$     51.00$             15.77$               47.31$              18.50$         55.50$               20.99$         62.97$               29.00$        87.00$                
HP C4909AN OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C4909AN C4909AN EA  HP 3 20.00$        60.00$                23.00$     69.00$             21.62$               64.86$              25.00$         75.00$               27.99$         83.97$               31.00$        93.00$                
HP C9393AN OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9393AN C9393AN EA  HP 3 20.00$        60.00$                23.00$     69.00$             21.07$               63.21$              25.00$         75.00$               26.99$         80.97$               31.00$        93.00$                
HP C9400A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW C9400A C9400A EA  HP 3 29.00$        87.00$                36.00$     108.00$          34.59$               103.77$           42.00$         126.00$             46.99$         140.97$            49.00$        147.00$              
HP CE742A OEM YELLOW OEM YELLOW CE742A CE742A EA  HP 3 239.00$      717.00$              214.00$   642.00$          210.77$            632.31$           240.50$       721.50$             274.99$      824.97$            308.00$      924.00$              
HP C9407A OEM YELLOWBLACK PRINTHEAD OEM YELLOWBLACK PRINTHEAD C9407A C9407A EA  HP 3 47.00$        141.00$              51.00$     153.00$          48.65$               145.95$           59.00$         177.00$             63.99$         191.97$            72.00$        216.00$              
HP C9406A OEM YELLOWMAGENTA PRINTHEAD OEM YELLOWMAGENTA PRINTHEAD C9406A C9406A EA  HP 3 47.00$        141.00$              51.00$     153.00$          48.65$               145.95$           59.00$         177.00$             63.99$         191.97$            72.00$        216.00$              
HP Q3985A OEM 220V FUSER KIT OEM 220V FUSER KIT Q3985A Q3985A EA  HP 3 260.00$      780.00$              320.00$   960.00$          284.38$            853.14$           356.00$       1,068.00$         291.99$      875.97$            418.00$      1,254.00$           

79,276.22$        80,136.31$    90,487.20$     106,023.50$     117,820.26$    143,028.84$      
*

*LOW BIDDER Terms Net 30 days 0% 20 days Net 30 days Net 30 days 2% 10 days Net 30 days

THE FOLLOWING IS A LIST OF VENDORS THAT WERE NOT TABULATED: EXTENSION 1 79,276.22$           

EXTENSION 2 79,276.22$           

Academic Supplier - No Addendum 3

Archive Supplies - No Addendums

CVR Computer Supplies - No Addendum No. 3

LD Products - Missing Several Items

Nolans Office Products, Inc. - No Addendums

Onlinetechstores.com, Inc. dba Suppliesoutlet.com - No Addendum No. 3

The Tree House, Inc. - No Addendums

V-Quest - No Addendum No. 3

SUB TOTAL FOR  ORIGINALS
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